
Question: 
 

I would like to raise a Freedom of Information request for the following information in 

relation the employment of community practitioners, community nurses, school 

nurses and health visitors. 

  

1. The numbers in the current employment cohort of community practitioners, 

community nurses, school nurses and health visitors – each categorised by full and 

part-time working, by trust area – for the latest available year and for the last five 

years; 

2. An assessment by either Trusts or Departments of the needed numbers employed in 

the roles of community practitioners, community nurses, school nurses and health 

visitors, full and part-time working, by trust area for latest available period; 

3. The numbers of community practitioners, community nurses, school nurses and 

health visitors employed either full or part-time– each given by trust area – for the 

latest available year and for the last five years; 

4. Estimations of the numbers of training places and supported training places for 

community practitioners, community nurses, school nurses and health visitors – by 

trust area – for the next five years, or failing that for as many years up to five as 

possible; 

5. The numbers of community practitioners, community nurses, school nurses and 

health visitors, full and part-time working, by trust area, who have retired from 

service through redundancy or other reason for the last year and year before that as 

well as any estimations of the numbers who will retire in the next three year period.  

6. Estimates of sickness or absentee levels of community practitioners, community 

nurses, school nurses and health visitors, categorised by full and part-time working 

and by trust area – for the latest year and year previous to that. 

 

Response: 
 

1. The numbers in the current employment cohort of community practitioners, 

community nurses, school nurses and health visitors – each categorised by full 



and part-time working, by trust area – for the latest available year and for the last 

five years;  

Information on the number of nurses and health visitors employed in Health and 

Social Care, split by Trust, full time/part time and type of nurse, is published annually 

in the NI HSC Workforce Census.  This information is available for a number of 

years, the most recent relating to March 2017.  Publications can be found on the 

DoH website at the following web address: https://www.health-ni.gov.uk/articles/staff-

numbers 

 

2. An assessment by either Trusts or Departments of the needed numbers 

employed in the roles of community practitioners, community nurses, school 

nurses and health visitors, full and part-time working, by trust area for latest 

available period;  

Information not held. 

 

3. The numbers of community practitioners, community nurses, school nurses and 

health visitors employed either full or part-time– each given by trust area – for 

the latest available year and for the last five years; 

Please see response to question 1. 

  

4. Estimations of the numbers of training places and supported training places for 

community practitioners, community nurses, school nurses and health visitors – 

by trust area – for the next five years, or failing that for as many years up to five 

as possible;  

Estimated figures are not held. The table below includes the number of places 

commissioned, by Health and Social Care Trust, for the year 2017-18 based on the 

education commissioning group plan. 

 

Programme Belfast Northern 
South 

Eastern 
Southern Western Total 

Specialist Practitioner: 
District Nursing (1 year 
full time) 

7 6 7 5 0 25 

https://www.health-ni.gov.uk/articles/staff-numbers
https://www.health-ni.gov.uk/articles/staff-numbers


Specialist Practitioner: 
Community Children's 
Nursing (1 year full 
time) 

2 2 0 2 1 7 

Health Visiting - 
SCPHN 

6 6 8 7 8 35 

Health Visiting - 
SCPHN (Part Time - 2 
Years) 

3 3 3 3 3 15 

School Nursing - 
SCPHN 

1 2 2 1 2 8 

SCPHN – Specialist Community Public Health Nursing 
 

5. The numbers of community practitioners, community nurses, school nurses and 

health visitors, full and part-time working, by trust area, who have retired from 

service through redundancy or other reason for the last year and year before that 

as well as any estimations of the numbers who will retire in the next three year 

period; 

Information not held. 

 

6. Estimates of sickness or absentee levels of community practitioners, community 

nurses, school nurses and health visitors, categorised by full and part-time 

working and by trust area – for the latest year and year previous to that.  

Information not held. 
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